0948-ORD
- 02/21/08

CITY OF BELLEVUE, WASHINGTON
ORDINANCE NO. 5752

AN ORDINANCE amending Chapter 23.30 of the Bellevue
City Code to amend the 2005 Edition of the National
Electrical Code to adopt by reference the 2005 updates,
including adoption of certain figures and drawings; and
establishing an effective date.

WHEREAS, the City of Bellevue includes electrical inspection as a component of
its comprehensive building inspection program; and

WHEREAS, under state law requirements the City is obligated to have in place
codes and standards that are equivalent to the electrical inspection program
administered by the Washington State Department of Labor and Industries; and

WHEREAS, adoption of the following amendments to the City’s Electrical Code
will maintain the required equivalency for the City’s electrical program; and

WHEREAS, the City of Bellevue has complied with the State Environmental
Policy Act (SEPA), Chapter 43.21C RCW, and the City's Environmental Procedures
Code, BCC 22.02; now, therefore,

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF BELLEVUE, WASHINGTON, DOES
ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Chapter 23.30 of the Bellevue City Code is hereby amended to read
as follows:

Chapter 23.30
Electrical Code
Sections:
23.30.010 Short Title.
23.30.015 National Electrical Code.
23.30.020 Conflicts.
23.30.025 Purpose.
23.30.030 Scope.
23.30.090.7 National Electrical code Article 90 amended — Examination of
Equipment for Safety.
23.30.100 National Electrical Code Article 100 amended — Definitions.
23.30.110.2 National Electrical Code Article 110.2 amended — Approval.

23.30.110.3 National Electrical Code Article 110.3 amended — Examination,
-+ identification, installation, and use of equipment.



0948-ORD
02/21/08

23.30.110.12

23.30.110.16

23.30.110.22

23.30.210.8

23.30.210.11

23.30.210.12

23.30.215.10

Article 220.12

23.30.220.87

23.30.225.32
23.30.230.2

23.30.230.28

23.30.230.43

23.30.230.70
23.30.230.90

23.30.230.95

23.30.230.202

23.30.250.32

23.30.250.50

23.30.250.56

23.30.250.104

23.30.250.184

23.30.300.4

- 23.30.300.11

National Electrical Code Article 110.12 amended — Mechanical
execution of work.

National Electrical Code Article 110.16 amended — Flash
protection.

National Electrical Code Article 110.22 amended — Identification of
disconnecting means.

National Electrical Code 210.8 amended — Ground fault circuit-
interrupter protection for personnel.

National Electrical Code 210.11 amended — Branch circuits
required.

National Electrical Code 210.12 amended — Arc-Fault Circuit-
Interrupter Protection. .
National Electrical Code 215.10 amended — Ground-fault protection
of equipment.

National Electrical Code is amended-Lighting Load for Specified
Occupancies.

National Electrical Code 220.87 amended — Determining existing
loads.

National Electrical Code 225.32 amended — Location.

National Electrical Code Article 230.2 amended — Number of
services.

National Electrical Code Article 230.28 amended — Service mast as
support.

National Electrical Code 230.43 amended — Wiring methods for 600
volts, nominal, or less.

National Electrical Code 230.70 amended — General.

National Electrical Code 230.90 amended — Service equipment —
Overcurrent protection.

National Electrical Code 230.95 amended — Ground-fault protection
of equipment.

National Electrical Code 230.202 amended — Service-entrance
conductors.

National Electrical Code 250.32 amended — Two or more buildings
or structures supplied from a common service.

National Electrical Code 250.50 amended — Grounding electrode
system.

National Electrical Code 250.56 amended — Resistance of rod, pipe
and plate electrodes.

National Electrical Code 250.104 amended — Bonding of piping
systems and exposed structural steel.

National Electrical Code 250.184 amended — Solidly grounded
neutral systems.

National Electrical Code 300.4 amended — Protection against
damage.

National Electrical Code 300.11 amended — Securing and
supporting.



0948-ORD
02/21/08

+23.30.310.12

23.30.314.15
23.30.314.29

23.30.334.10
23.30.334.12

23.30.358.12
23.30.394.12
23.30.406.15
23.30.410.4

23.30.410.30

23.30.422.10

23.30.450.42

23.30.501.200

23.30.514.11

23.30.517.30
23.30.519
-”2‘3.30.520.44
23.30.525.1
23.30.553.4
23.30.553.6
23.30.553.7
23.30.555.1

23.30.555.5
23.30.555.7

National Electrical Code Article 310.12 amended — Conductor
identification.

National Electrical Code Article 314.15 amended — Damp, wet, or
hazardous (classified) locations.

National Electrical Code Article 314.29 amended — Boxes and
conduit bodies to be accessible.

National Electrical Code Article 334.10 amended — Uses permitted.
National Electrical Code Article 334.12 amended — Uses not
permitted.

National Electrical Code Article 358.12 amended — Uses not
permitted.

National Electrical Code Article 394.12 amended — Uses not
permitted.

National Electrical Code Article 406 amended — Tamper Resistant
Receptacles.

National Electrical Code Article 41.4 amended — Luminaries
(Fixtures) in specific locations.

National Electrical Code Article 410.30 amended — Cord-connected
lampholders and luminaires.

National Electrical Code Article 422.10 amended — Branch-circuit
rating.23.30.450.27 National Electrical Code Article 450.27
amended — Oil-insulated transformers installed outdoors.

National Electrical Code Article 501 amended — Sewage Disposal
Systems.

National Electrical Code article 501 amended — Sewage Disposal
Systems.

National Electrical Code Article 514.11 amended — Circuit
disconnects.

National Electrical Code Article 517.30 amended — Essential
Electrical Systems for Hospitals.

National Electrical Code Article 519 created — Education and
Institutional Occupancies.

National Electrical Code Article 520.44 Table deleted — Ampacity of
listed extra-hard-usage cords and cables.

National Electrical Code Article 525.1 amended — scope.

National Electrical Code Article 553.4 amended — Location of
service equipment.

National Electrical Code Article 553.6 amended — Feeder
conductors.

National Electrical Code Article 553.7(B) amended — Wiring
methods.

National Electrical Code Article 555.1 amended — Scope.
National Electrical Code Article 555.5 amended — Transformers.
National Electrical Code Article 555.7 amended — Location of
service equipment.



0948-ORD
02/21/08

23.30.555.9

23.30.5565.10

23.30.555.13

23.30.555.19
23.30.555.21

23.30.590.1
23.30.590.4
23.30.600.3
23.30.600.10
23.30.600.21

23.30.600.30
23.30.680.4

23.30.680.12
23.30.680.13
23.30.680.40
23.30.680.70
23.30.700.6
23.30.700.9

23.30.700.12

- 23.30.700.27

23.30.700.30

23.30.701.7

23.30.701.11

23.30.701.18
23.30.760.3

23.30.760.10

23.30.760.12
- 23.30.770.3

National Electrical Code Article 555.9 amended — Electrical
connections.

National Electrical Code Article 555.10 amended — Electrical
equipment enclosures.

National Electrical Code Article 555.13 amended — Wiring methods
and installation.

National Electrical Code Article 555.19 amended — Receptacles.
National Electrical Code Article 555.21 amended — Gasoline
dispensing stations — Hazardous (classified) locations.

National Electrical Code Article 590.1 amended — Scope.
National Electrical Code Article 590.4(G) amended — Splices.
National Electrical Code Article 600.3 amended — Listing.
National Electrical Code Article 600.10 amended — Portable or
mobile signs.

National Electrical Code Article 600.21 amended — Ballasts,
transformers, and electronic power supplies.

National Electrical Code Article 600.30 amended — Applicability.
National Electrical Code Article 680.4 amended — Approval of
equipment.

National Electrical Code Article 680.12 amended — Maintenance
disconnecting means.

National Electrical Code Article 680.13 new — Field installed
equipment.

National Electrical Code Article 680.40 amended — General.
National Electrical Code Article 680.70 amended — General.
National Electrical Code Article 700.6 amended — Transfer
Equipment.

National Electrical Code Article 700.9 amended — Wiring,
emergency systems.

National Electrical Code Article 700.12 amended — Sources of
power.

National Electrical Code Article 700.27 amended —-Coordination.
National Electrical Code Article 700.30 new — Smoke Control
Systems, Pressurization Wiring and Equipment.

National Electrical Code Article 701.7 amended — Transfer
equipment.

National Electrical Code Article 701.11 amended — Legally required
standby systems.

National Electrical Code Article 700.18 amended — Coordination.
National Electrical Code Article 760.10 amended — Fire alarm
circuit identification.

National Electrical Code Article 760.10 amended — Fire alarm
circuit identification.

National Electrical Code Article 760 amended — Fire alarm systems.
National Electrical Code Atrticle 770.3 amended — Other articles.



0948-ORD

02/21/08

23.30.800.3 National Electrical Code Article 800.3 amended — Other articles.

23.30.800.30 National Electrical Code Article 800 amended — Communication
circuits.

23.30.900 Figures and Drawings

23.30.010 Short title.

This chapter shall be known as the electrical code of the city of Bellevue, which is
hereinafter referred to as the “city of Bellevue electrical code,” “electrical code” or as
“this chapter.”

23.30.015 National Electrical Code.

The 2005 Edition of the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70), including Annex A, B and
C, but excluding Article 80; the 2003 Edition of Standard for the Installation of Stationary
Pumps for fire Protection (NFPA 20); Health Care Facilities (NFPA 99); the 2005 Edition
of Standard for Emergency and Standby Power Systems (NFPA 110); Commercial
Building Telecommunications Cabling Standard (ANSI/TIA/EIA 568-B.1-May 2001
including Annex 1 through 5); Commercial Building Standard for Telecommunications
Pathway and Spaces (ANSI/TIA/EIA 569-A-7 December 2001 including Annex 1
through 4); Commercial Building Grounding and Bonding Requirements for
Telecommunications (ANSI/TIA/EIA 607 - A - 2002); Residential Telecommunications
Cable Standard (ANSI/TIA/EIA 570-A-December 2001); and the National Electrical
Safety Code (NESC C2-2002), but excluding Appendices A and B are adopted and
shall be applicable within the city, as amended, added to and excepted in this chapter.

23.30.020 Conflicts.

A. The requirements of this chapter shall govern where there is any conflict between
this chapter and the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70), Centrifugal Fire Pumps (NFPA
20), Health Care Facilities (NFPA 99), and Emergency and Standby Power Systems
(NFPA 110).

B. The National Electrical Code shall govern where there is any conflict between
Centrifugal Fire Pumps (NFPA 20), Health Care Facilities (NFPA 99), Emergency and
Standby Power Systems (NFPA 110), or the National Electrical Safety Code (NESC C2-
2002) and the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70).

C. In accordance with RCW 19.28.010(3), where the State of Washington, Department
of Labor and Industries adopts a more current edition of the National Electrical Code
(NFPA 70) the Building Official may supplement use of this Code with newly adopted
editions of the National Electrical Code.



0948-ORD
02/21/08

23.30.030 Scope.

A. The City of Bellevue electrical code covers the installation of electric conductors,
electric equipment and additions, alterations, modifications, or repairs to existing
electrical installations for the following:

1. Electric conductors, electric equipment, and electrical raceways installed within or
on public and private buildings, property or other structures.

2. Signaling and communications conductors and equipment, telecommunications
conductors and equipment, fiber optic cables, and raceways installed within or on
public and private buildings, property or other structures.

3. Yards, lots, parking lots, and industrial substations.
4. Temporary electrical installations for use during the construction of buildings.

5. Temporary electrical installations for carnivals, conventions, festivals, fairs,
traveling shows, the holding of religious services, temporary lighting of streets, or
other approved uses.

6. Installations of conductors and equipment that connect to a supply of electricity.
7. All other outside electrical conductors on the premises.
8. Optional standby systems derived from portable generators.

‘B. Exception. All wires and equipment that fall within Section 90.2(b)(5) of the National
Electrical Code, 1981 Edition, are exempt from the requirements of this chapter.

23.30.090.7 National Electrical code Article 90 amended — Examination of
Equipment for Safety.

Article 90 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented to read as
follows:

90.7 Examination of equipment for safety. For specific items of equipment and materials
referred to in this Code, examinations for safety made under standard conditions, to a
recognized United States or harmonized international standard, provide a basis for
approval where the record is made generally available through promulgation by
organizations properly equipped and qualified for experimental testing, inspections of
the run of goods at factories, and service-value determination through field inspections.
This avoids the necessity for repetition of examinations by different examiners,
frequently with inadequate facilities for such work, and the confusion that would result
from conflicting reports on the suitability of devices and materials examined for a given
purpose.



0948-ORD
02/21/08

It is the intent of this Code that factory-installed internal wiring or the construction of
equipment need not be inspected at the time of installation of the equipment, except to
detect alterations or damage, if the equipment has been listed by a qualified electrical
testing laboratory that is recognized as having the facilities described in the preceding
paragraph-and that requires suitability for installation in accordance with this Code.

23.30.100 National Electrical Code Article 100 amended — Definitions.

Article 100 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following definitions to read as follows:

"Amusement structure” means electrical or mechanical devices or combinations
of devices operated for revenue and to provide amusement or entertainment to
viewers or audiences at carnivals, fairs, or amusement parks. "Amusement
structure” also means a bungee jumping device regardless of where located.
"Amusement structure" does not include games in which a member of the public
shall perform an act, nor concessions at which customers may make purchases.

"Amusement ride" means any vehicle, boat, bungee jumping device, or other
mechanical device moving upon or within a structure, along cables or rails,
through the air by centrifugal force or otherwise, or across water, that is used to
convey one or more individuals for amusement, entertainment, diversion, or
recreation. "Amusement ride" includes, but is not limited to, devices commonly
known as skyrides, ferris wheels, carousels, parachute towers, tunnels of love,
bungee jumping devices, and roller coasters. "Amusement ride" does not include:
(a) Conveyances for persons in recreational winter sports activities such as ski
lifts, ski tows, j-bars, t-bars, and similar devices subject to regulation under
Chapter 70.80 RCW; (b) any single-passenger coin-operated ride that is
manually, mechanically, or electrically operated and customarily placed in a
public location and that does not normally require the supervision or services of
an operator; (c) non-mechanized playground equipment, including but not limited
to, swings, seesaws, stationary spring-mounted animal features, rider-propelled
merry-go-rounds, climbers, slides, trampolines, and physical fithess devices; or
(d) water slides.

“Building” is a structure that stands alone or that is separated from adjoining
structures by a minimum two hour rated fire walls, and protected openings
complying with the provisions of Section 705 of the International Building Code.
The extent and location of such fire walls shall provide a complete separation.

“Certified electrical product” means an electrical product to which a laboratory,
accredited by the State of Washington, has the laboratory’s certification mark
attached.



0948-ORD
02/21/08

“Certification mark” is a specified laboratory label, symbol, or other identifying
mark that indicates the manufacturer produced the product in compliance with
appropriate standards or that the product has been tested for specific end uses.

“City” means the City of Bellevue.

“Chapter” unless elsewhere specified means this chapter 23.30, unless expressly
used for separate reference.

“Educational Occupancy” refers to a building or portion of a building used primarily
for educational purposes by six or more persons at one time for twelve hours per
week or four hours in any one day. Educational occupancy includes: Schools
(preschool through grade twelve), colleges, academies, universities, and trade
schools.

“Electrical equipment” includes electrical conductors, conduit, raceway,
apparatus, materials, components, and other electrical equipment not exempted
by RCW 19.28.006(8). Any conduit/raceway of a type listed for electrical use is
considered to be electrical equipment even if no wiring is installed in the
conduit/raceway at the time of the conduit/raceway installation.

“Electrical products certification laboratory” is a laboratory or firm accredited by
the state of Washington to perform certification of electrical products.

“Electrical products evaluation laboratory” is a laboratory or firm accredited by the
state of Washington to perform on-site field evaluation of electrical products for
safety.

“Field evaluated” means an electrical product to which a field evaluation mark is
attached. Field evaluation shall include job site inspection unless waived by the
department, and may include component sampling and/or laboratory testing.

“Field evaluation mark” is a specified laboratory label, symbol, or other identifying
mark indicating the manufacturer produced the product in essential compliance
with appropriate standards or that the product has been evaluated for specific
end uses.

“Fished wiring” is when cable or conduit is installed within the finished surfaces of
an existing building or building structure (e.g., wall, floor or ceiling cavity).

“High-Rise Building” are buildings having occupied floors located more than 75
feet above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

Exception: the following buildings and structures as defined in the
- International Building Code shall not be considered as a high-rise building:



0948-ORD
02/21/08

1. Airport traffic control towers in accordance with IBC Section 412.
2. Open parking garages in accordance with IBC Section 406.3.

3. Buildings with an occupancy in Group A-5 in accordance with IBC Section
3003.1

4. Low-Hazard special industrial occupancies in accordance with IBC Section
503.1.2

5. Buildings with an occupancy in Group H-1, H-2 or H-3 in accordance with
IBC Section 415.

“IBC” means the International Building Code.

“Industrial control panel” means a factory or user wired assembly of industrial
control equipment such as motor controllers, switches, relays, power supplies,
computers, cathode ray tubes, transducers, and auxiliary devices used in the
manufacturing process to control industrial utilization equipment. The panel may
-include disconnecting means and motor branch circuit protective devices.
Industrial control panels include only those used in a manufacturing process in a
food processing or industrial plant.

“Installation” includes the act of installing, connecting, repairing, modifying, or
otherwise performing work on an electrical system, component, equipment, or
wire except as exempted by WAC 296-46B-925.

“Institutional Occupancy” refers to a building or portion of a building used primarily
for detention and correctional occupancies where some degree of restraint or
security is required for a time period of twenty-four or more hours. Such occupancies
include, but are not restricted to: Penal institutions, reformatories, jails, detention
centers, correctional centers, and residential-restrained care.

“Identification plate” is a phenolic or metallic plate or other similar material engraved
in block letters at least 1/4” (6mm) high unless specifically required to be larger by
this chapter, suitable for the environment and application. The letters and the
background shall be in contrasting colors. Screws, rivets, or methods specifically
described in this chapter shall be used to affix an identification plate to the
equipment or enclosure.

“Labeled” means an electrical product that bears a certification mark issued by a
laboratory accredited by the state of Washington.

“Laboratory” may be either an electrical product(s) certification laboratory or an
electrical product(s) evaluation laboratory.



0948-ORD
02/21/08

“Like-in-kind” means having similar characteristics such as voltage requirement,
current draw, circuit overcurrent and short circuit characteristics, and function within
the system. Like-in-kind also includes any equipment component authorized by the
manufacturer as a suitable component replacement part.

“Listed” means equipment has been listed and identified by a laboratory approved by
the State of Washington for the appropriate equipment standard per this chapter.

“‘Low voltage” means:
(a) NEC, Class 1 power limited circuits at 30 volts maximum.

(b) NEC, Class 2 circuits powered by a Class 2 power supply as defined in NEC
725.41(A).

(c) NEC, Class 3 circuits powered by a Class 3 power supply as defined in NEC
725.41(A).

(d) Circuits of Telecommunications systems as defined in chapter 19.28 RCW.

“NRTL” means Nationally Recognized Testing Laboratory accredited by the federal
Occupational Safety and Health Administration (OSHA) after meeting the
requirements of 29 CFR 1910.7.

“Point of contact” for utility work, means the point at which a customer’s electrical
system connects to the serving utility system.

“Stand-alone amplified sound or public address system” is a system that has distinct
wiring and equipment for audio signal generation, recording, processing,
amplification, and reproduction. This definition does not apply to telecommunications
installations.

“Telecommunications installations” is as defined in RCW 19.28.400 for both
regulated carriers and unregulated local service providers.

“Under the control of a utility” for the purposes of RCW 19.28.091 is when electrical
equipment is owned by the utility or when electrical equipment is not owned by a
utility and:

(a) Is located in a vault, room, closet, or similar enclosure that is secured by a lock or
seal so that access is restricted to the utility’s personnel; or:

(b) The utility is obligated by contract to maintain the equipment and the contract

provides that access to the equipment is restricted to the utility’s personnel or other
qualified personnel.

10



0948-ORD
02/21/08

“Utility system” means electrical equipment owned by or under the control of a
serving utility that is used for the transmission or distribution of electricity from the
source of supply to the point of contact.

“Utilization voltage” means the voltage level employed by the utility’s customer for
connection to lighting fixtures, motors, heaters, or other electrically operated
equipment other than power transformers.

“WAC” means Washington Administrative Code.
23.30.110.2 National Electrical Code Article 110.2 amended — Approval.

Article 110.2 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to the end of Article 110.2:

All materials, devices, appliances, and equipment, not exempted in state law
chapter 19.28. RCW, shall conform to applicable standards recognized by the
Building Official, be listed, or field evaluated by an accredited electrical products
testing laboratory. Equipment shall not be energized until such standards are
met, unless specific permission has been granted by the Building Official.

23.30.110.3 National Electrical Code Article 110.3 amended — Examination,
. identification, installation, and use of equipment.

Article 110.3 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection to be known as subsection 110.3(C), to read as follows:

(C) Industrial control paneis and utilization equipment. Control panels and
utilization equipment installed in industrial plants will be determined to meet the
minimum electrical safety standards for installations by one of the following
methods:

(a) Listing and Labeling by an accredited electrical products testing laboratory.
(b) Field evaluation by an accredited electrical products testing laboratory:

(i) If the equipment usage is changed to other than industrial utilization
equipment or electrical modifications are made to the equipment, the equipment
must be successfully listed or field evaluated by an accredited electrical products
testing laboratory approved by the State of Washington under WAC 296-46B-
999.

(i) The equipment shall be permanently installed at the owner's facility and
inspected per the requirements of this Chapter.

11



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(c) Normal inspection as part of the electrical inspection process included with
the general wiring inspection of a building, structure, or other electrical
installation for compliance with codes and rules adopted under this chapter.
Normal inspection will only be made for equipment using listed components and
wired to the requirements of the NEC.

Use of industrial control panel(s) or equipment before its evaluation or final
inspection, must be authorized by the Building Official or designated
representative prior to its being energized.

23.30.110.12- National Electrical Code Article 110.12 amended -~ Mechanical
execution of work.

Article 110.12 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of new subsections to be known as 110.12(D) and 110.12(E), to read as
follows:

(D) Abandoned Conductors and Cables. Electrical conductors or cables shall not
be abandoned in place. Unused electrical conductors, or cables, regardiess of
voltage, and communication cables not in use shall be removed from the building
or structure back to the originating panel board unless otherwise authorized by
the Building Official or designated representative.

(E) Old, Used or Damaged Material and Equipment. Old, used or damaged
electrical equipment, conductors or materials shall not be reinstalled or used in
any new work without prior approval of the Building Official or designated
representative.

23.30.110.16 National Electrical Code Article 110.16 amended — Flash protection.

Article 110.16 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to the end of the first paragraph, to read as follows:

The flash protection marking shall be an identification plate or label meeting
ANSI Standards Z535.4-1998 or be of a type approved by the Building Official or
designated representative. The plate or label may be installed at the factory or in
the field. The plate or label may be mounted using adhesive. The plate or label
shall include the flash hazard category, the incident energy level in cal/cm? at 18
inches from the flash hazard, and the flash hazard boundary.

23.30.110.22 National Electrical Code Article 110.22 amended - ldentification of
disconnecting means.

A. Article 110.22 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
the addition of the fcliowing text to the end of the first paragraph, to read as follows:

12



0948-ORD
02/21/08

In other than dwelling units, an identification plate or label is required unless the
disconnect is a circuit breaker or fused switch installed within a panelboard and
its purpose is indicated by the panelboard schedule. The identification plate or
label shall include the identification designation of the circuit source panelboard
that supplies the disconnect.

B. Article 110.22 of the National Electrical Code further is amended and
supplemented by the addition of the following text to the end of the second paragraph,
to read as follows:

The marking shall be in the form of an identification plate or label that is
substantially yellow in color. The words “CAUTION — SERIES COMBINATION
RATED SYSTEM” shall be on the plate or label in letters at least 13 mm (1/2")
high.

23.30.210.8 National Electrical Code 210.8 amended — Ground fault circuit-
interrupter protection for personnel.

B. Article 210.8 of the National Electrical Code is amended to read as follows:

(B) Other Than Dwelling Units All 125-volt, single-phase, 15- and 20-ampere
receptacles installed in the locations specified in (1) through (6) shall have
ground-fault circuit-interrupter protection for personnel:

(1) Bathrooms

(2) Commercial and institutional kitchens — for the purposes of this section, a
kitchen is an area with a sink and permanent facilities for food preparation and
cooking

(3) Rooftops

(4) Outdoors in public spaces—for the purpose of this section a public space is
defined as any space that is for use by, or is accessible to, the public

Exception to (3) and (4): Receptacles that are not readily accessible and are
supplied from a dedicated branch circuit for electric snow-melting or deicing
equipment shall be permitted to be installed in accordance with the applicable
provisions of Article 426.

(5) Outdoors, where installed to comply with 210.63.
(6) Countertop surfaces where installed within 1.8 m (6 ft) of any sink, fixed water

source, or a normally wet or damp location. EXCEPTION: The laundry receptacle
when installed within the dedicated wall space occupied by the clothes washer.

13



0948-ORD
02/21/08

23.30.210.11 National Electrical Code 210.11 amended — Branch circuits required.

Article 210.11 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the

addition of a new subsection to be known as subsection 210.111(4), to read as follows:
(4) Unfinished spaces. In addition to the number of branch circuits required by
other parts of this section, at least one additional branch circuit shall be provided
for unfinished spaces adaptable to future dwelling unit living areas that are not
readily accessible to the service or branch circuit panelboard. The circuits shall
terminate in a suitable box(es). The box shall contain an identification of the
intended purpose of the circuit(s). The branch circuit panelboard shall have
adequate space and capacity for the intended load(s).

23.30.210.12 National Electrical Code 210.12 amended — Arc-Fault Circuit-
Interrupter Protection.

Article 210.12 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to the end of the first paragraph to read as follows:

For the purpose of this section, dwelling unit bedrooms include spaces that are:
1. Accessed only through the bedroom
2. Ancillary to the bedroom’s function; and
3. Contain branch circuits that supply 125 volt, 15 and 20 ampere outlets.

For the purposes of this section, such spaces will include, but not be limited to, spaces
such as closets and sitting areas, but will not include bathrooms.

Branch/feeder AFCls shall be permitted to be used to meet the requirements of
210.12(B) until January 1, 2008.

Exception: The location of the arc-fault circuit interrupter shall be permitted to be at
other than the origination of the branch circuit provided:
1. -The arc-fault circuit interrupter installed within 1.8 m (6 ft) of the branch circuit
overcurrent device as measured along the branch circuit conductors.
2. The circuit conductors between the branch circuit overcurrent device and the arc-
fault circuit interrupter shall be installed in a metal raceway or a cable with a
metallic sheath.

23.30.215.10 National Electrical Code 215.10 amended — Ground-fault protection
of equipment.

Article 215.10 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new paragraph following the first paragraph of Article 215.10 to read as
follows:

Equipment ground fault protection systems shall be performance tested prior to - -
being placed into service to verify proper installation and operation of the system

14



0948-ORD
02/21/08

as determined by the manufacturer's published instructions. This test or a
subsequent test shall include all system feeders. A firm having qualified
personnel and proper equipment shall perform the tests required. A copy of the
manufacturer's performance testing instructions and a written performance
acceptance test record signed by the person performing the test shall be
provided for the inspector's records at the time of inspection. The performance
acceptance test record shall include test details including, but not limited to all
trip settings and measurements taken during the test. The equipment being
tested shall be labeled identifying the date of the test, the firm performing the
test, and all settings for the equipment tested.

23.30.220.12 National Electrical Code 220.12 amended ~ Lighting Load for
Specified Occupancies.

Article 220.12 of National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the addition
of the following text to the following the first paragraph to read as follows:

Exception: In determining feeder and service entrance conductor sizes and equipment
ratings, the currently adopted Washington State Energy Code unit lighting power
allowance table and footnotes may be used in lieu of NEC 220.12

23.30.220.87 National Electrical Code 220.87 amended — Determining existing
loads.

Article 220.87 of National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to the end of subsection (1) Exception to read as follows:

In addition to the 30-day demand data, the following information shall be
provided: :

(a) The date of the measurements.
(b) A statement attesting to the validity of the demand data, signed by a
professional electrical engineer or the electrical administrator of the electrical
contractor performing the measurement(c) A diagram of the electrical system
identifying the point(s) of the measurements.
23.30.225.32 National Electrical Code 225.32 amended — Location.
A. Article 225.32 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by

the addition of a new paragraph following the first paragraph of Article 225.32 to read as
follows: : D

15



0948-ORD
02/21/08

Feeder disconnects, panelboards, subpanels, and similar electrical equipment
shall be installed so that they are readily accessible and may not be installed in
bathrooms, clothes closets, or shower rooms. All indoor feeder disconnects,
panelboards and subpanels and similar electrical equipment shall have adequate
working space and be adequately illuminated.

B. Article 225.32 of the National Electrical Code is further amended and

supplemented by the addition of new subsections to be known as subsection 225.32(1)

and 225.32(2), to read as follows:

(1) Outside locations: Where the feeder disconnecting means is installed outside
of a building or structure it shall be on the building or structure supplied. The
building disconnecting means may supply only 1 building or structure unless the
secondary building(s) or structure(s) has a separate building disconnecting

" means meeting the requirements of this subsection. The disconnecting means
shall have an identification plate with at least 1/2” high letters identifying:

(a) The building or structure served; and

(b) Its function as the building or structure main disconnect(s).

(2) Inside location: Where the feeder disconnecting means is installed inside the
building or structure, it shall be located so that the feeder raceway or cable

extends no more than 15’ inside the building or structure.

23.30.230.2 National Electrical Code Article 230.2 amended — Number of services.

A. Article 230.2 of the National Eiectrical Code is amended and supplemented by the °

addition of a new paragraph following the first paragraph to read as follows:

Each portion of a building or structure separated by one or more Fire Walls that

- - comply with Section 705 of the International Building Code may be considered a
separate building. Fire Walls shall not be less than 2 hr fire-resistance rated. The
extent and location of such Fire Walls shall provide a complete separation.

23.30.230.28 National Electrical Code Article 230.28 amended — Service mast as
support.

Article 230.28 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the

addition of the following text to the end of the first paragraph to read as follows:

Where a raceway-type service mast is used as support for service-drop
conductors the following conditions shall be met:

(1) Raceway type service mast shall be a minimum of 2 inch rigid metal conduit.

16



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(2) An approved roof flashing be installed on each mast where it passes through
a roof. Plastic, non-hardening mastic shall be placed between lead-type flashings
and the conduit. Approved neoprene type roof flashings may be permitted.

(3) Masts shall be braced, secured, and supported in such a manner that no
pressure from the attached conductors will be exerted on a roof flashing, meter
base, or other enclosures.

(4) Utilization of couplings for a mast shall not be permitted above the point the
mast is braced, secured, or supported.

(5) Except as otherwise required by the serving utility, service mast support guys
shall be installed if the service drop attaches to the mast more than 600 mm (24
in.) above the roof line or if the service drop is greater than 100" in length from
the pole or support. Masts for support of other than service drops shall comply
with this requirement as well.

(6) Intermediate support masts shall be installed in an approved manner with
methods identical or equal to those required for service masts.

(7) For altered services, where it is impractical to install U bolt mast supports due
to interior walls remaining closed, it may be permissible to use other alternate
mast support methods'such as heavy gauge, galvanized, electrical channel
material that is secured to 2 or more wooden studs with 5/16” diameter or larger
galvanized lag bolts.

(8) Conductors shall extend a minimum of 450 mm (18 in.) from all mastheads to
permit connection to the connecting overhead wiring.

23.30.230.43 National Electrical Code 230.43 amended — Wiring methods for 600
volts, nominal, or less.

Article 230.43 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to the end of Article 230.43, to read as follows:

Wiring methods for service conductors not exceeding 600 volts, nominal, within a
building or structure is limited to the following methods:

1. Rigid metal conduit; Intermediate metal conduit;

2. Wireways;

3. Busways;

4. Auxiliary gutters;

5. Rigid nonmetallic conduit;

6. Cablebus; |

17



0948-ORD
02/21/08

7. Mineral-insulated, metal-sheathed cable (type Ml).

EXCEPTION: With the approval of the Building Official existing electrical metallic
tubing used for service entrance conductors may be permitted to remain,
provided it meets all of the following conditions:

(a) It was installed prior to October 1984

(b) It is properly grounded

(c) The conduit is installed in a non-accessible location
(d) It is the proper size for the installed conductors.

23.30.230.70 National Electrical Code 230.70 amended — General.

Article 230.70 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of new subsections to be known as 230.70(A)(1)(a) and 230.70(A)(1)(b), to

read as follows:

(a) Outside location: The service disconnect means shall be installed on the
building or structure it serves. The service disconnection means shall be labeled
with a plate with 1/2 inch letters providing the following information:

(i) the building or structure served; and
(ii) Its function as the building or structure main service disconnect(s).

(b) Inside location: Where the service disconnect is installed inside the building or
structure, it shall be located so that the service raceway extends no more than 15
feet inside the building or structure served. Service disconnecting means, panel
boards, subpanels and similar electrical equipment shall be adequately
illuminated.

Article 230.70(A)(2) of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented to |
read as follows:

(2) Bathrooms. Service disconnection means, panel boards, subpanels and
similar electrical equipment shall not be installed in bathrooms, clothes closets,
or shower rooms.

23.30.230.90 National Electrical Code 230.90 amended — Service equipment —
Overcurrent protection.

Article 230.90 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to the end of Article 230.90(A) Exception No. 3 to read as
follows:

18



0948-ORD
02/21/08

Where the service conductors have a lesser ampacity than the overcurrent
protection or the equipment rating that they terminate in or on, an identification
plate showing the ampacity of the conductors shall be installed on the service
equipment.

23.30.230.95 National Electrical Code 230.95 amended — Ground-fault protection
of equipment.

Article 230.95 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following paragraph to follow the first paragraph to read as follows:

Equipment ground fault protection systems shall be performance tested prior to
being placed into service to verify proper installation and operation of the system
as determined by the manufacturer's published instructions. This test or a
subsequent test shall include all system feeders. A firm having qualified
personnel and proper equipment must perform the tests required. A copy of the
manufacturer's performance testing instructions and a written performance
acceptance test record signed by the person performing the test must be
provided for the inspector's records at the time of inspection. The performance
acceptance test record shall include test details including, but not limited to all
trip settings and measurements taken during the test. The equipment being
tested shall be labeled identifying the date of the test, the firm performing the
test, and all settings for the equipment tested.

23.30.230.202 National Electrical Code 230.202 amended — Service-entrance
conductors.

Article 230.202 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplementéd by the
addition of the following text to the end of Article 230.202 subsection (B) to read as
follows:

Wiring methods for service conductors exceeding 600 volts, nominal, within a
building or structure is limited to the following methods:

1. Rigid metal conduit;

2.. Intermediate metal conduit;

3. Busways;

4.Schedule 80 rigid nonmetallic conduit;

5. Cablebus;

6.Metal-clad cable that is exposed for its entire length.

23.30.250.32 National Electrical Code 250.32 amended —~ Two or more buildings or
structures supplied from a common service.

19



0948-ORD
02/21/08

Article 250.32 of the National Electrical Code is amended by the deletion of subsection
250.32 (B)(2) in its entirety.

23.30.250.50 National Electrical Code 250.50 amended — Grounding velectrode
system.

Article 250.50 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection to be known as subsection 250.50(1), to read as follows:

(1) At each new building or structure served a concrete-encased grounding
electrode consisting of at least 6.0 m (20 ft) of bare copper conductor not smaller
than #4 AWG meeting the requirements of Article 250-52(A)(3) shall be required
as part of the grounding electrode system. Other electrodes of bare or zinc
coated steel reinforcing bars or rods meeting the requirements of 250.52(A)(3)
may be used if approved by the Building official prior to installation. All electrodes
shall be inspected prior to covering, concealing or the placing of concrete.

EXCEPTION: New buildings or structures, job site construction trailers, mobile
homes and manufactured homes, when not installed on a permanent concrete
foundation.

23.30.250.104 National Electrical Code 250.104 amended — Bonding of piping
systems and exposed structural steel.

Article 250.104 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of new subsection 250.104 (A)(4) , to read as follows:

(4) Bondihg hot and cold metallic water piping. Hot and cold metal water piping
systems are not required to be bonded together if, at the time of inspection, the
inspector can determine the metal water piping systems are mechanically and
electrically joined by 1 or more metallic mixing valves. Metallic stubs or valves
used in-ncnmetallic plumbing systems are -not required to be bonded to the
electrical system unless required by the equipment manufacturer’s instructions.

23.30.250.184 National Electrical Code 250.184 amended — Solidly grounded
neutral systems.

Article 250.184(A) of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
the addition of new subsections to be known as subsection 250.184(A)3) and
subsection 250.184(A)( 4), to read as follows:

( 3) Existing installations.

a. The use of a concentric shield will be allowed for use as a neutral

- conductor for extension, replacement, or repair, if all of the following are
complied with:

20



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(i) The existing system uses the concentric shield as a neutral conductor;

(if) Each individual conductor contains a separate concentric shield sized
to no less than 33 1/2% of the ampacity of the phase conductor for 3-
phase systems or 100% of the ampacity of the phase conductor for single-
phase systems;

(iii) The new or replacement cable’s concentric shield is enclosed inside
an outer insulating jacket; and

(iv) Existing cable (i.e. existing cable installed directly in the circuit
between the work and the circuit's overcurrent device) successfully
passes the following tests:

(1) A cable maintenance high potential dielectric test. The test shall
be performed in accordance with the cable manufacturer's
instruction or the 2001 NETA maintenance test specifications; and
(2) A resistance test of the cable shield. Resistance shall be based
on the type, size, and length of the conductor used as the cable
shield using the conductor properties described in NEC Table 8
Conductor Properties.

An electrical engineer shall provide a specific certification to the
Building Official or designated representative in writing that the test
results of the maintenance high potential dielectric test and the
resistance test have been reviewed by the electrical engineer and that
the cable shield is appropriate for the installation. The electrical
engineer shall stamp the certification document with the engineer's
stamp and signature. The document may be in the form of a letter or
electrical plans.

Testing results are valid for a period of 7 years from the date of testing.
Cable will not be required to be tested at a shorter interval.

b. A concentric shield used as a neutral conductor in a multi-grounded system
fulfills the requirements of an equipment grounding conductor.

¢. Where a separate conductor is used as the neutral for an extension,
replacement, or repair, the conductor shall pass a resistance test. Resistance
shall be based on the type, size, and length of the conductor used as the cable
shield using the conductor properties described in NEC Table 8 Conductor
Properties.

{4) New installations.

21



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(a) New installations shall not include extensions of existing circuits.
(b) The use of the concentric shield will not be allowed for use as a neutral
conductor for new installations. A listed separate neutral conductor meeting
the requirements of NEC 250.184(A) shall be installed.
- Article 250.184 of the National Electrical Code is further amended and supplemented
by the deletion of the text of subsection 250.184(B) and replacing it with the following
text to read as follows:

(B) Single Point Grounded Systems. The neutral of a solidly grounded neutral
system may be grounded at more than one point.

(1) Multiple grounding is permitted at the following locations:
(a) Services;
(b) Underground circuits where the neutral is exposed;
(c) overhead circuits installed outdoors.

(2) Multiple grounding is not allowed:

(a) For new systems where singlepoint and multigrounded circuits form a
single system (e.g. where a singlepoint circuit is derived from a multigrounded
circuit); or

(b) In new single phase (i.e. single phase to ground) installations.

Article 250.184 of the National Electrical Code is further amended and supplemented
by the deletion of the text of subsection 250.184(C)(2) through (5) and replacing it with
the following text to read as follows:

(2) Where a multigrounded neutral system is used, the following will apply for

new balanced phase to phase circuits and extensions, additions, replacements;

and repairs to all existing systems of 1 kV and over:

(a) For existing systems:

(i) The cable’s concentric shield shall be used as the neutral and all the
requirements for neutral conductors described in WAC 296-46B-250-6(a)
shall be met; or

(i) The cable’s concentric shield shall be effectively grounded to a separate

bare copper neutral conductor- at all locations where the shield is exposed to
personnel contact.

22



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(b) For new systems a separate copper neutral shall be installed and the cable’s
concentric shield is effectively grounded to the separate neutral at all locations
where the shield is exposed to personnel contact.

(c) In addition to (a) and (b) of this subsection, the following is required:

(i) A minimum of 2 made electrodes, separated by at least 6, shall be
installed at each existing and new transformer and switching/overcurrent
location and connected to the neutral conductor at that location;

(i) At least 1 grounding electrode must be installed and connected to the
multigrounded neutral every 400m (1,300 ft.). The maximum distance
between adjacent electrodes shall not be more than 400m (1,300 ft.);

(iii) In a multigrounded shielded cable system, the shielding shall be grounded
at each cable joint that is exposed to personnel contact;

(iv) All exposed noncurrent carrying metal parts (e.g. mounting brackets,
manhole covers, equipment enclosures, etc.) shall be effectively grounded to
the neutral conductor; and

(v) An electrical engineer shall provide a specific certification to the electrical
plan review supervisor in writing that the design of the multiple grounding
installation has been reviewed by the electrical engineer and the design is in
accordance with the requirements of chapter 19.28 RCW, this chapter, and
normal standards of care. The electrical engineer shall stamp the certification
document with the engineer's stamp and signature. The document may be in
the form of a letter or electrical plans.

23.30.300.11 National Electrical Code 300.11 amended — Securing and supportmg

Artlcle 300.11(A) of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented to read
as follows:

(A) Secured in Place. Raceways, cable assemblies, boxes, cabinets, and fittings
shall be securely fastened in place. Support wires that do not provide secure
support will not be permitted as the sole support. Where permitted by the
Building Official and not restricted by Article 300, raceways, cables, or boxes
may be installed in suspended ceilings under the following conditions:

(i) Cables, raceways and boxes shall not be supported by the ceiling grid
system.

23



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(ii) The raceways or cables shall serve equipment that is located within the
ceiling cavity or equipment that is mounted on or supported by the ceiling grid
system. . : :

(1) Telecommunications cables, Class 2 cables, or Class 3 cables
supported as required by this section, may pass through ceiling
cavities without serving equipment mounted on or supported by the
ceiling grid system.

(ii) The support wires shall be independent of the ceiling support systems and
be capable of securing and supporting the raceways, cables or boxes without
reducing the integrity of the suspended ceiling system;

(iv) The independent support wires shall be a minimum #12 AWG and
adequate to carry the weight and are securely fastened to the building
structure and to the ceiling grid;

(v) Raceways and/or cables are not larger than 3/4” trade size;

(vi) No more than 2 raceways or cables may be supported by any
independent support wires and are secured to the support wires by fittings
designed and manufactured for the purpose;

(vi) Where support wires are installed exclusively for telecommunications
cables, NEC power limited, Class 2, or Class 3 cables the maximum number
of cables allowed shall not be more than 2 inch diameter when bundled
together.

23.30.310.12 National Electrical Code Article 310.12 amended — Conductor
identification.

- - Article 310.12 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection to be known as subsection 310.12(D), to read as follows:

(D) Each cable operating at over 600 volts and installed on customer owned
systems shall be legibly marked in a permanent manner at each termination point
and at each point the cable is accessible. The required marking shall use phase
designation, operating voltage, and circuit number if applicable.

23.30.334.10 National Electrical Code Article 334.10 amended ~ Uses permitted.
Article 334.10 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the

addition of the following text to the end of subsection (2) of Article 334.10, to read as
follows:

24



0948-ORD
02/21/08

Where the building or structure exceeds three floors above grade, type NM, NMC
and NMS cables shall be concealed within walls, floors, and ceilings that provide
a thermal barrier of material that has at least a 15-minute finish rating as
identified in listings of fire-rated assembilies.

23.30.334.12 National Electrical Code Article 334.12 amended ~ Uses not
permitted.

Article 334.12 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection to be known as subsection 334.12(A)(11), to read as
follows:

(11) In Type | or Type Il non-combustible construction as defined by the Building
Official.

23.30.358.12 National Electrical Code Article 358.12 amended - Uses not
permitted.

Article 358.12 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection to be known as subsection 358.12(7), to read as follows:
(7) Installed in direct contact with the earth or in concrete on or below grade.

23.30.394.12 National Electrical Code Article 394.12 amended -~ Uses not
permitted.

Article 394.12 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new Exception to Article 394.12(5), to read as follows:

Exception: In hollow spaces containing existing knob-and-tube wiring may be
allowed to remain provided that all of the following conditions are met:

(i) The wiring shall be surveyed by an appropriately licensed electrical eontractor - -
who must certify in writing to the Building Official that the wiring is in good
condition with no evidence of improper overcurrent protection, conductor
insulation failure or deterioration, and with no improper connections or splices.
The electrical inspector must inspect all repairs, alterations, or extensions to the
electrical system;

(i) The insulation shall meet Class | specifications as identified in the Uniform
Building Code, with a flame spread factor of 25 or less as tested using ASTM
E84-81a. Foam insulation may not be used with knob-and-tube wiring;

(iii) All knob-and-tube circuits shall have overcurrent protection in compliance

with NEC Table 310.16, 60 degree centigrade, Column C. Overcurrent protectlon
- shall be circuit breakers or Type S fuses.

25



0948-ORD
02/21/08

23.30.406.15 National Electrical Code Article 406 amended — Tamper Resistant
Receptacles.

Article 406 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new section to be known as Section 406.15, to read as follows:

406.15 Tamper-Resistant Receptacles. Listed tamper-resistant receptacles or listed
tamper-resistant receptacle cover plates are required in all licensed day care centers, all
licensed child group care facilities and psychiatric patient care facilities where
accessible to children five years of age and under. Listed tamper-resistant receptacles
are required in psychiatric patient care facilities where accessible to psychiatric patients
over five years of age.

23.30.410.4 National Electrical Code Article 410.4 amended - Luminaires (Fixtures)
in Specific Locations

Article 410.4 D of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to the end of the Article 410.4D to read as follows:

All luminaires (lighting fixtures) located within a designated shower stall or
bathtub area installed less than 2.5 m (8 ft) measured vertically from the shower
stall threshold or bathtub rim or bathtub platform shall be fully enclosed and
protected by a ground-fault circuit-interrupter.

23.30.410.30 National Electrical Code Article 410.30 amended — Cord-connected
lampholders and luminaires.

Article 410.30 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
~ addition- of a new subsection to be kriown as subsection 410.30(C)(1)(3), to read as
follows:

(3) The flexible cord connection shall comply with the following:

(a) Connection to a suspended pendant box shall utilize an approved cable
connector or clamp to an integral threaded hub;

(b) The length of the cord for a suspended pendant drop from a permanently
installed junction box to a suitable tension take-up device shall not exceed
1.8m (6 ft);

(c) The flexible cord shall be supported at each end with an approved cord
grip or strain relief connector fitting/device that will eliminate all stress on the
conductor connections;

(d) The flexible cord shall be a minimum #14 AWG copper,

26



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(e) The flexible cord ampacity shall be determined in NEC Table 400.5(A)
column A;

(f) The flexible cord shall be hard or extra hard usage; and

(g) A vertical flexible cord supplying electric discharge luminaires shall be
secured to the luminaire support as per NEC 334.30(A).

23.30.422.10 National Electrical Code Article 422.10 amended — Branch-circuit
rating.

Article 422.10 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to the end of Article 422.10(A), to read as follows:

Water heaters with a rated circuit load in excess of 3,500 watts, but less than
4900 watts, at 208 or 240 volts shall be provided with branch circuit conductors
not smaller than #10 AWG copper or equal. Overcurrent protection shall comply
with NEC 422.11(E).

23.30.450.27 National Electrical Code Article 450.27 amended - OQil-insulated
transformers installed outdoors.

Article 450.27 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to the end of the last paragraph of Article 450.27 to read as
follows:

Oil-insulated transformers located adjacent to building(s) or structures shall
comply with the following: AR

(1) Transformers shall not be located closer than 2.5 m (8 ft) to any part of a
building or structure constructed of combustible material including any eaves,
overhangs or decks;

(2) Transformers shall not be located closer than 900 mm (2 ft) to any part of a
building or structure constructed of non-combustible material including any
eaves, overhangs or decks and must be outside a line extended vertically from
the ends of the eaves, overhangs or rooflines of the building or structure;

(3) Transformers shall not be located closer than 2.5 m (8 ft) to any part of doors,
windows, stairways, ventilation openings, other types of openings of all buildings
or structures;

(4) Transformers shall be located such that any oil leaking from the transformer
will flow away from the building or structure and will not pool; and

27



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(5) Transformers located in areas subject to vehicular traffic shall be provided
with adequate guarding.

(6) Enclosures for total underground oil filled transformers shall not be located
closer than 2.5 m (8 ft) to any part of a doorway, window, stairway or fire escape.
Adequate space must be maintained above the enclosure so that a boom may be
used to lift the transformer from the enclosure.

23.30.450.42 National Electrical Code Article 450.42 amended — Walls, Roofs, and
Floors.

Article 450.42 Exception of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented
to read as follows:

Exception: Where transformers are protected with automatic sprinkler, water spray,
carbon dioxide, or halon and installed in buildings or structures with 5 floors or less
above finished grade, construction of 1-hour rating shall be permitted.

23.30.501.200 National Electrical Code Article 501 amended — Sewage Disposal
Systems.

Article 501 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new Section 501.200, to read as follows:

501.200 Sewage Disposal Systems.

(1) Pumping chambers for sewage, effluent, or grinder pumps in on-site and septic tank
effluent pump (S.T.E.P.) disposal systems will be considered unclassified when not
more than five residential units are connected to the system, residential units are
connected to a utility sewage system, or when nonresidential systems have
residential loading characteristics and all of the following general installations
requirements are complied with:

(a) The pumping chamber shall be adequately vented. Venting may be
accomplished through the building or structure plumbing vents where the
system venting has been approved by the local jurisdiction authority or by a
direct two-inch minimum vent to the atmosphere;

(b) Equipment that in normal operation may cause an arc or spark shall not be
installed in any pumping chamber

(c) Float switches installed in a pumping chamber shall be hermetically sealed to
prevent the entrance of gases or vapors; (d) Junction boxes, conduits and
fittings installed in the septic atmosphere shall be of a non-corrosive type,
installed to prevent the entrance of gases or vapors;

28



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(e) Where a conduit system is installed between the pumping chamber and the
control panel, motor disconnect, or power source, an approved sealing
method shall be installed to prevent the migration of gases or vapors from the
pumping chamber, and shall remain accessible; and

(f) Wire splices in junction boxes installed in pumping chambers shall be suitable
for wet locations.

(2) Residential wastewater loading characteristics in a nonresidential installation:

(a) For systems that process less than three thousand five hundred gallons of
wastewater per day may be certified by:

(i) An on-site wastewater designer licensed under chapter 18.210 RCW; or

(ii) A professional engineer, engaged in the business of on-site
wastewater system design, licensed under chapter 18.43 RCW.

(b) For systems that process three thousand five hundred gallons or more of
wastewater per day may be certified by a professional engineer, engaged in
the business of on-site wastewater system design, licensed under chapter
18.43 RCW.

Written documentation shall be signed and stamped by the designer or engineer and
provided to the electrical inspector prior to inspection.

(3) Any residential or nonresidential system that has building or structure floor drains
being discharged into the system is classified as Class | Division I. Drains from any
commercially made tub, shower, basin, sink, or toilet are not considered floor drains.

(4) Pumping chamber access covers can be covered by gravel, light aggregate, or
noncohesive -granulated soil, and shall be accessible for excavation. Access covers
that are buried shall have their exact location identified at the electrical panel or
other prominent location by an identification plate. The authority having jurisdiction
for performing electrical inspections must approve the identification plate location.

(5) Indoor grinder pumps installed in chambers with less than fifty gallons capacity are
not required to meet the requirements of this section, except for the venting
requirements in subsection (1)(a) of this section. Indoor grinder pumps installed in
chambers with less than fifty gallons capacity are not classified systems as
described in Article 500 NEC.

(6) Secondary treatment effluent pumping chambers such as sand filters are
unclassified, and require no special wiring methods.

29



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(7) Inspection approval is required prior to covering or concealing any portion of the
septic electrical system, including the pump. New septic and effluent tanks
containing electrical wires and equipment shall be inspected and approved prior to
being loaded with sewage.

23.30.514.11 National Electrical Code Article 514.11 amended -~ Circuit
disconnects.

Article 514.11 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to the last paragraph of Article 514.11(A), to read as
follows:

The disconnecting means shall disconnect all conductors of the circuit supplying
all station dispensers and/or pumps (including the grounded conductor)
simultaneously from the source(s) of supply.
For multi-circuit installations, an electrically held normally open contactor
operated by a push-button or other suitable device may serve as the
disconnecting means. The push button or disconnecting device shall not function
as the resetting mechanism for the electrically held contactor. The resetting
means shall meet the following:

(1) Located at least 4.5 m (15 ft) or out of sight of the pushbutton; and

(2) Protected by a suitable cover or guard; and

(3) Identified with an approved identification plate that is substantially black in
color with white lettering. '

The disconnecting means shall be labeled with an identification plate, with letters
at least 1” high, as the emergency disconnecting means.

The disconnecting means or operator shall be:
(1) Substantially red in color; and

(2) For attended facilities — Shall be readily accessible and shall be located
outdoors and within sight of the pump or dispensing equipment it controls; or

(3) For unattended facilities — shall be readily accessible and shall be located

within sight, but at least 20’ from the pump or dispensing equipment it
controls.

30



0948-ORD
02/21/08

23.30.517.30 National Electrical Code Article 517.30 amended - Essential -

Electrical Systems for Hospitals.

Article 517.30(D) of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented to read
as follows:

(D) Capacity of Systems. In health care facilities, the following methods shall be
used to determine adequate capacity and ratings of equipment provudmg
electrical power for the essential electrical systems.

(1) Systems in new facilities:

(a) Emergency system: The emergency branch shall consist of 2 branches
known as:

(i) Life safety system: The feeder conductors and equipment used to
supply electrical power to the life safety branch shall be determined by
summation of the connected loads as determined by article 220 NEC
and may not be subjected to any reduction due to the diversity of the
loads. Feeder and equipment will be subject to a 125% muiltiplier for
continuous loads in accordance with article 220 NEC.

(i) Critical branch system: The feeder conductors and equipment shall
be calculated in accordance with article 220 NEC, including a level of
diversity as determined by such article.

(b) Equipment branch: The feeder conductors and equipment used to supply
electrical power to the equipment branch of the essential electrical system
shall be calculated in accordance with article 220 NEC, including a level of
diversity as determined by such article.

(c) Generator sizing: The rating of the generator(s) supplying electrical power
to the essential system of a health care facility shall meet or exceed the
summation of the loads determined in (a) and (b) of this subsection with no
additional demand factors applied. Momentary X-ray loads may be ignored if
the generator is rated at least 300% of the largest momentary X-ray load
connected.

(2) Existing essential systems in facilities to which additional load is to be added:

(a) Existing loads: The existing loads of the separate branches of the
essential electrical system may be determined by NEC Article 220.35(1).

(b) Added loads: Added loads to the separate branches of the essential
clectrical system shall be determined by subsection (a) of this section.

31



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(c) Generator sizing: The rating of the generator(s) supplying electrical power
to the essential electrical system shall meet or exceed the summation of the
loads determined by (a) and (b) of this subsection with no additional demand
factors applied.

23.30.519 National Electrical Code Article 519 created - Educational and
Institutional Occupancies.

The National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the addition of a new
Article to be known as Article 519 — Educational and Institutional Occupancies to read
as follows:

ARTICLE 519 Educational and Institutional Occupancies

519.1 Scope. This article covers educational and institutional occupancies as
defined in the Article.

519.3 Definitions. The following definitions apply to this Article.

A. Educational Occupancy refers to a building or portion of a building used primarily
for educational purposes by six or more persons at one time for twelve hours per
week or four hours in any one day. Educational occupancy includes: Schools
(preschool through grade twelve), colleges, academies, universities, and trade
schools.

B. Institutional Occupancy refers to a building or portion of a building used primarily
for detention and correctional occupancies where some degree of restraint or
security is required for a time period of twenty-four or more hours. Such
occupancies include, but are not restricted to: Penal institutions, reformatories,
jails, detention centers, correctional centers, and residential-restrained care.

-519:.5 Wiring Methods. The wiring methods in educational or institutional -

occupancies shall be limited to metallic or nonmetallic raceways, MI, MC, or AC
cable.

Exception: limited energy system may use wiring methods in accordance with the this
Code.

23.30.520.44 National Electrical Code Article 520.44 Table deleted — Ampacity of
listed extra-hard-usage cords and cables.

Article 520.44 Table of the National Electrical Code is deleted and all references to

Table 520.44 in NEC Article 520. The ampacity of conductors shall be determined as
provided in NEC Article 400.

32



0948-ORD
02/21/08

23.30.525.1 National Electrical Code Article 525.1 amended — Scope.
Article 525.1 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
amending Article 525.1 to read as follows:

525.1 Scope. This article covers the installation of portable wiring and equipment for
carnivals, circuses, fairs, and similar functions, including wiring in or on all structures. In
addition to the requirements in this Article, all wiring and equipment for carnivals,
circuses, fairs, and similar functions shall also comply with WAC 296-403A.

23.30.553.4 National Electrical Code Article 553.4 amended — Location of service
equipment.

Article 553.4 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
amending Article 553.4 to read as follows:

5563.4 Location of Service Equipment. The service equipment for floating
buildings and similar facilities shall have a readily accessible service rated
disconnect located on the shoreline within sight of the shoreline connection of the
dock, wharf or similar structure to which the floating building or similar facility is
moored.

23.30.553.6 National Electrical Code Article 553.6 amended — Feeder conductors.

Article 553.6 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of new text to follow the first paragraph of Article 553.6, to read as follows:

Floating buildings or similar facilities shall have a disconnecting means located
within sight of each floating building or similar faciiity. The disconnecting means
shall be installed adjacent to but not in or on, the floating building or similar
facility.

- 23:30.553.7 National Electrical Code Article 553.7(B) amended — Wiring methods.

Article 553.7(B) of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of new text to follow the first paragraph of Article 553.7(B), to read as follows:

Where flexible cables or cords are used they shall comply with Article 555.13(2).
Conductors operating in excess of 600 volts, nominal, shall not be installed on
floating portions of a floating building or similar facility.

23.30.555.1 National Electrical Code Article 555.1 amended — Scope.

Article 555.1 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
amending the last paragraph of Article 555.1 to read as follows:

33



0948-ORD
02/21/08

Private, non-commercial docking facilities constructed or occupied for the use of
the owner or residence of the associated single family dwelling are covered by
this article.

23.30.555.5 National Electrical Code Article 555.5 amended — Transformers.

Article 555.5 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
amending the last paragraph of Article 555.5 to read as follows:

Transformers and enclosures shall be specifically approved for the intended
location. The bottom of enclosures for transformers shall be located a minimum
of 12" above the deck of a dock.

23.30.555.7 National Electrical Code Article 555.7 amended —~ Location of service
equipment.

Article 555.7 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
amending the last paragraph of Article 555.7 to read as follows:

The service equipment for floating docks or marinas shall be located adjacent to
and within sight but not on or in, the floating structure.

23.30.555.9 National Electrical Code Article 555.9 amended -~ Electrical
connections.

Article 555.9 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new exception to read as follows:

Exception: Connections approved for wet locations.

23.30.555.10 National Electrical Code Article 555.10 amended - Electrical
equipment enclosures. - . e .

Article 555.10 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to follow the first sentence of subsection (B), to read as
follows:

All enclosures shall be corrosion resistant, gasketed enclosures shall be
arranged with a weep hole to discharge condensation.

23.30.555.13 National Electrical Code Article 555.13 amended — Wiring methods
and installation.

Article 555.13 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
amending the first paragraph of subsection (B)(1) of Article 555.13 to read as follows:

34



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(1) Overhead Wiring. Overhead wiring shall be installed to avoid possible contact
with masts and other parts of boats being moored, stored, serviced or moved.

23.30.555.19 National Electrical Code Article 555.19 émended — Receptacles.

Article 555.19 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to follow the first sentence of Article 555.19 to read as
follows:

Shore Power Receptacles that provide shore power for boats shall be rated not
less than 20 amperes and shall be single outlet type and shall be of the locking
and grounding type or pin and sleeve type.

23.30.555.21 National Electrical Code Article 555.21 amended - Gasoline
dispensing stations — Hazardous (classified) locations.

Article 555.21 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of new subsections to follow the first sentence of Article 555.21 to be known as
Article 555.21(A) and 555.21(B), to read as follows:

(A) Boundary classifications.

(1) Class |, Division 1. The area under the dispensing unit is a Class |,
Division 1 location. If a dock has one or more voids, pits, vaults, boxes,
depressions, or similar spaces where flammable liquid or vapor can
accumulate below the dock surface and within 20" horizontally of the
dispensing unit, then the area below the top of the dock and within 20’
~horizontaliy of the dispensing unit is a Class |, Division 1 location.

(2) Class 1, Division 2. The area 18" above the water line and within 20’
horizontally of the dispensing unit is a Class |, Division 2 location. If a dock
has one or more voids, pits, vaults, boxes depressions, or similar spaces
where flammable liquid or vapor can accumulate below the dock surface and
within 20" horizontally of the dispensing unit, then the area to 18" above the
top and adjacent to the sides of the dock and within 20" horizontally of the
dispensing unit is a Class |, Division 2 location.

(B) Portable power cable. Portable power cable will be allowed as a permanent
wiring method in Class 1, Division 2 locations when protected from physical
damage.

23.30.590.1 National Electrical Code Article 590.1 amended — Scope.

Article 590.1 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented to read as
follows: : : e

35



0948-ORD
02/21/08

550.1 Scope. The provisions of this article apply to temporary electrical power and
lighting installations. For the purposes of this section, any circuit used for construction
purposes is considered to be temporary.

23.30.590.4 National Electrical Code Article 590.4(G) amended — Splices.

Article 590.4(G) of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
amending the first sentence of Article 590.4(G), to read as follows:

(G) Splices. On construction sites, a junction box is required for splices or
junction connections where splices of conductors are less than 2.5 m (8 ft) from
grade or floor level or where subject to contact from personnel.

23.30.600.3 National Electrical Code Article 600.3 amended - Listing.

Article 600.3 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following new text to follow the first paragraph, to read as follows:

Electric signs within the scope of Underwriters Laboratories Standards for
Electric Signs UL 48, shall be listed. Electric signs not covered under the
Standards for Electric Signs UL 48 shall be required to be installed in
conformance with this Code or be field evaluated by an accredited electrical
products testing laboratory.

23.30.600.10 National Electrical Code Article 600.10 amended — Portable or mobile
signs.

Article 600.10 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the’
addition of a new subsection (C) to Article 600.10, to read as follows:

(C) Wet or Damp Location. Portable or mobile signs in wet or damp locations
shall comply with 600.10(C)(1) and (C)(2). Each portable or mobile sign shall
have a receptacle outlet, which complies with 406.8(B), installed within 1.8 m (6
ft) of the sign.

Article 600.10 of the National Electrical Code is further amended and supplemented by
the addition of a new subsection (E) to read as follows:

(E) Supply. Extension cords shall not be permitted to supply portable or mobile
signs.

23.30.600.21 National Electrical Code Article 600.21 amended - Ballasts,
transformers, and electronic power supplies.

Article 600.210f the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection (G), to read as follows:

36



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(G) Outside Awnings. Luminaires installed in outdoor awnings shall be of a type
that is suitable for wet locations and be connected by a wiring method suitable for
wet locations. Fluorescent luminaires shall be installed so that no part of the
luminaire is located closer than 6" to the awning fabric. Incandescent luminaires
shall be installed so that no part of the luminaire is located closer than 18" to the
awning fabric. Luminaires instailed in outside awnings shall be controlled by a
disconnect installed in conformance with 600.6.

23.30.600.30 National Electrical Code Article 600.30 amended — Applicability.

Article 600.30 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
amending Article 600.30 to read as follows:

600.30 Applicability. Part Il of this article shall apply to all field-installed skeleton
tubing and neon circuit conductors. These requirements are in addition to the
requirements in Part I.

23.30.680.4 National Electrical Code Artlcle 680.4 amended - Approval of
equipment.

Article 680.4 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following new text to follow the first paragraph, to read as follows:

Electrical components which have failed and require replacement be replaced
with identical products unless the replacement part is no longer available; in
which case, -a like-in-kind product may be substituted prov1ded the mechamcal
and grounding integrity of the equipment is maintained. ‘

23.30.680.12 National Electrical Code Article 680.12 amended - Maintenance
Disconnecting Means.

Article 680.12 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of new text to the end of the first paragraph to read as follows:

The maintenance disconnect for a swimming pool, hot tub, spa, or swim spa shall
not be located closer than 5' from the inside wall of the pool, hot tub, spa, or
swim spa.

23.30.680.13 National Electrical Code Article 680.13 new - Field installed
equipment.

Article 680 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new section to be known as Section 680.13 to read as follows:

37



0948-ORD
02/21/08

680.13 Field Installed Equipment. Field installed electrical equipment for a
swimming pool, hot tub, spa or swim spa shall not be located closer than 5' from
inside wall of the swimming pool, hot tub, spa or swim spa. The 5' separation
may be reduced by the installation of a permanent barrier, such as a solid wall,
fixed glass windows or doors, etc. The 5' separation shall be determined by the
shortest path or route that a cord can travel from the spa, hot tub, swim spa, or
swimming pool to the equipment.

Field installed electrical equipment shall meet the following additional
requirements:

(1) Heaters are listed as a “swimming pool heater or a spa heater”;

(2) Pumps are listed as a “swimming pool pump” or “spa pump” or “swimming
pool/spa pump”;

(3) Other equipment such as panelboards, conduit, and wire are suitable for
the environment and comply with the applicable codes.

(4) The field assembly or installation of “recognized components” shall not be
permitted.

23.30.680.40 National Electrical Code Article 680.40 amended — General.

Article 680.40 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection (A) and a new subsection (B), to read as follows:

" (A) Modular, Self-Contained Spa or Hot Tubs. Equipment assemblies for self-
contained spas or hot tubs shall be installed within 1.5 m (5 ft.) from the inside
wall of the spa or hot tub. Equipment assemblies shall be listed or field evaluated
as a unit with the spa or hot tub.

(B) Packaged Spa or Hot Tub Equipment Assemblies. Equipment assemblies
(skid pack) pre-packaged by a factory shall not be installed closer than 1.5 m

(5 ft.) from the inside wall of the spa or hot tub and shall be listed as a package
unit.

23.30.680.70 National Electrical Code Article 680.70 amended — General.

Article 680.70 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of the following text to the end of the first paragraph, to read as follows:

Hydromassage bathtubs shall be listed as a unit and bear a listing mark which
reads “Hydromassage bathtub.”

38



0948-ORD
02/21/08

23.30.700.6 National Electrical Code Article 700.6 amended — Transfer Equipment.
Article 700.6 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection (E) to read as follows:

(E) Location. In high-rise buildings and underground buildings, per IBC 403 and
405 respectively, the emergency transfer switches where required by the IBC or
this code shall be located in a separate room from the normal power source
including transformers and distribution equipment and shall be enclosed in a
room constructed of not less than 2-hour fire-resistive-rated fire barriers
ventilated directly to and from the exterior. The emergency transfer switches,
where required by the IBC or this code in other buildings or uses, shall be located
in a separate room from the normal power source including transformers and
distribution equipment and shall be enclosed in a room constructed of not less
than 1-hour fire-resistive-rated fire barriers ventilated directly to and from the
exterior. Power distribution from the two sources to the emergency transfer
switches shall be by independent routes.

Exception: System components described in Article 701 may occupy the same
dedicated spaces as emergency systems.

23.30.700.9 National Electrical Code Article 700.9 amended — Wiring, Emergency
Systems.

Article 700.9 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
amending Article 700.9(A) to read as follows:

(A) Identification.

(1) Emergency systems. All boxes and enclosures larger than 150 mm (6 in.)
by 150 mm (6 in.) (including transfer switches, generators and power panels)
for emergency circuits shall be permanently marked with an identification
plate that is orange in color so they will be readily identified as a component
of the emergency circuit or system. All other device and junction boxes for
emergency systems and circuits shall be orange in color, both inside and
outside.

(2) Smoke Control Systems. All boxes and enclosures larger than 150 mm (6
in.) by 150 mm (6 in.) (including transfer switches, generators and power
panels) for smoke control power and circuits shall be permanently marked
with an identification plate that is orange in color with a yellow diagonal stripe
so they will be readily identified as a component of the smoke control circuit
or system. All other device and junction boxes for smoke control systems and
circuits shall be orange in color both inside and outside. Cover plates shall be
orange in color with a yellow diagonal stripe. Raceways for stair and elevator
pressurization system wiring shall be identified by labels or color coding and
shall be visible at the time of inspection.

39



0948-ORD
02/21/08

23.30.700.12 National Electrical Code Article 700.12 amended — Sources of Power.
Article 700.12 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
- addition of new text added to the first paragraph to read as follows:

For energization of specific emergency equipment see City of Bellevue Building
Code Article 23.10.403 Tabie 403(1).

“Article 700.12 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new paragraph following the last paragraph to read as follows:

In high-rise buildings and underground buildings, per IBC 403 and 405
respectively, the emergency source of power shall be located in a separate room
from the normal power source including transformers and distribution equipment
and shall be enclosed in a room constructed of not less than 2-hour fire-resistive-
rated fire barriers ventilated directly to and from the exterior. In other buildings or
uses the emergency source of power, where required by the IBC or this code
shall be located in a separate room from the normal power source including
transformers and distribution equipment and shall be enclosed in a room
constructed of not less than 1-hour fire-resistive-rated fire barriers ventilated
directly to and from the exterior. Power distribution from the emergency source to
the emergency transfer switch shall be by an independent route from the normal
source.

Article 700.12(B)(6) of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
the addition of new text following the first paragraph to read as follows:

A generator set located less than 3 m (10 ft) from the building(s) shall be
enclosed within an approved structure of 1-hour fire resistive construction. Where
located more than 3 m (10 ft) but less than 6 m (20 ft) shall be within an
approved enclosure.

23.30.700.27 National Electrical Code Article 700.27 amended — Coordination.

Article 700.27 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new exception following the first paragraph to read as follows:

Exception: The requirements for selective coordination described are not required
where the emergency system was installed prior to June 1, 2006. For new
emergency systems that are supplied from an existing emergency system installed
prior to June 1, 2006, the new portion of the emergency system shall comply with
NEC 700.27. The ground fault sensing function of overcurrent protective devices will
only be required to selectively coordinate with the ground fault sensing functions of
other overcurrent protective devices.

40



0948-ORD
02/21/08

23.30.700.30 National Electrical Code Article 700.30 new — Smoke Control
Systems, Pressurization Wiring and Equipment.

Article 700 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new section to be known as Section 700.30 to read as follows:

700.30 Smoke Control Systems, Pressurization Wiring and Equipment. Where
smoke control, stair pressurization and elevator pressurization is required by City of
Bellevue Building Code Chapter 23.10, all power and control wiring and equipment,
including the emergency source of power and transfer switch(s) for smoke control, stair
pressurization and elevator pressurization systems shall be installed in accordance with
this Article (NEC 700-Emergencey Systems), and IBC Section 403 HIGH-RISE
BUILDINGS, IBC Section 405 UNDERGROUNG BUILDINGS and IBC Section 909
SMOKE CONTROL SYSTEMS as amended and adopted by the City of Bellevue Building
Code 23.10.

23.30.701.7 National Electrical Code Article 701.7 amended — Transfer Equipment.
Article 701.7 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection (D) to read as follows: :

(D) Location. In high-rise buildings the legally required standby source of power and its
transfer switches shall be located in a separate room from the normal power source
including transformers and distribution equipment and shall be enclosed in a room
constructed of not less than 2-hour fire-resistive-rated fire barriers ventilated directly to
and from the exterior. Power distribution from the two sources shall be by independent
routes.

Exception: Systern components described in Article 700 may occupy the same
dedicated spaces as the legally required standby systems.

23.30.701.11 National Electrical Code Article 701.11 amended — Legally Required
Standby Systems.

Article 701.11(B)(5) of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by
the addition of new text following the first paragraph to read as follows:

A generator set located less than 3 m (10 ft) from the building(s) shall be
enclosed within an approved structure of 1-hour fire resistive construction. Where

located more than 3 m (10 ft) but less than 6 m (20 ft) shall be within an
approved enclosure.

23.30.701.18 National Electrical Code Article 701.18 amended — Coordination.

Article 701.18 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new exception following the first paragraph to read as follows:

41



0948-ORD
02/21/08

Exception: The requirements for selective coordination described are not required
where the legally required standby system was installed prior to June 1, 2006. For
new .legally required standby systems that are supplied from an existing legally
required standby system installed prior to June 1, 2006, the new portion of the
legally required standby system shall comply with NEC 701.18. The ground fault
sensing function of overcurrent protective devices will only be required to selectively
coordinate with the ground fault sensing functions of other overcurrent protective
devices.

23.30.760.3 National Electrical Code Article 760.3 amended — Other Articles
Article 760.3 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection (G) to read as follows:

(G) Suspended Ceilings. The installation of fire alarm cables and raceways installed in
hollow spaces of suspended ceilings shall comply with Section 300.11(A) of this code.

23.30.760.10 National Electrical Code Article 760.10 amended — Fire alarm circuit
identification.

Article 760.10 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of new text to follow the end of the first paragraph, to read as follows:

Device and junction boxes for fire alarm systems shall be red in color, both
inside and outside. Power-limited fire protective signaling circuit conductors
shall be durably and plainly marked in or on junction boxes or other
enclosures to indicate that it is a power-limited fire protective signaling circuit.

All device boxes, junction boxes and enclosures for smoke control systems
larger than 150 mm (6 in.) by 150 mm (6 in.) shall be permanently marked
with an identification plate that is red in color with a yellow diagonal stripe so
they will be readily identified as a component of the smoke control circuit or
system. All other device and junction boxes for smoke control systems and
circuits shall be red in color both inside and outside. Cover plates shall be red
in color with a yellow diagonal stripe,

23.30.760.12 National Electrical Code Article 760 amended - Fire Alarm Systems.

Article 760 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new Section 760.12 to read as follows:

760.12 Detection and control systems. Wiring for fire detection systems providing
power, detection, or control input or output signals to mechanical smoke control
systems, stair and elevator pressurization systems or elements thereof shall be fully
enclosed within a continuous metallic raceway system. The installation of the wiring
system shall be installed in accordance with this Article (NEC 760-Fire Alarm Systems),
IBC Section 403 HIGH-RISE BUILDINGS, IBC Section 405 UNDERGROUND

42



0948-ORD
02/21/08

BUILDINGS and IBC Section 909 SMOKE CONTROL SYSTEMS as amended and
adopted by the City of Bellevue Building Code 23.10. The installation shall ensure the
survivability of circuits for the specified time for evacuation of the building as determined
by the Fire Code Official.

--23.30.770.3 National Electrical Code Article 770.3 amended — Other Articles.
Article 770.3 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection (C) to read as follows:

(C) Suspended Ceilings. The installation of optical fiber cables and raceways installed
in hollow spaces of suspended ceilings shall comply with Section 300.11(A) of this
code.

23.30.800.3 National Electrical Code Article 800.3 amended — Other Articles.
Article 800.3 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new subsection (E) to read as follows:

(E) Suspended Ceilings. The installation of communication cables and raceways
installed in hollow spaces of suspended ceilings shall comply with Section 300.11(A) of
this code.

23.30.800.30 National Electrical Code Article 800 amended — Communications
Circuits.

Article 800 of the National Electrical Code is amended and supplemented by the
addition of a new Section 800.4 to read as follows:

800.4 Designation of Telecommunications Network Demarcation Point.
(A) Definitions.

(1) “CWSTP (Cable, Wire and Service Termination Policy)” is the policy of- the
Federal Communications Commission (FCC) and the Washington Utilities and
Transportation Commission (WUTC) prescribed by tariff that governs
negotiations between building owners and telecommunications service providers
regarding the configuration of POP(s) and demarcation point(s) in multi-tenant
buildings when a MPOE policy is not elected by the telecommunications service
provider.

(2) “MPOE (Minimum Point of Entry)” is a building wiring policy of the FCC and
WUTC for multi tenant environment locations that can be elected by
telecommunications service providers. It prescribes that the telecommunications
service provider will provide a single POP for access to it's network and is
located either at the closest practicable point to where a telecommunications
service provider's facilities (fiber, coax, or copper) crosses a property line or at -
the closest practicable point to where the wiring enters a multiunit building or

43



0948-ORD
02/21/08

buildings. All demarcations provided for customers and end-users by the provider
will be placed within 12 inches of that POP.

(3) “POP (Point-of-Presence)”, also called a “POT (Point-of-Termination)”, is a
designated point at or near a customer premise at which a telecommunications
service provider’s facilities for the provision of access service ends. This can be a
fiber, coax, or copper connection point. Depending on the telecommunications
service provider's CWSTP with the individual building owner demarcations may
be established at the POP or at other designated locations. When the customer
of a telecommunications service provider is another carrier, the demarcation will
be at the closest POP to the end-user. A telecommunications service provider
may have multiple POPs within a multiple tenant environment.

(B) Installation.

(1) All telecommunications installations on an end-user's property, beyond the end-
user's telecommunications network demarcation point, made by a
telecommunications service provider, both inside and outside of a building or
structure, shall conform to all licensing, certification, installation, permitting, and
inspection requirements described in chapter 19.28 RCW and this code.

(2) Telecommunications service providers including its subcontractors and agents
shall install and maintain points of demarcation in conformance with Code of
Federal Regulations (CFR), Title 47, Chapter 1, Part 68, Subpart B, Sec. 68.105
and may not place a.point of demarcation further than 12 inches within a end-
user’'s occupied space.

(3) The telecommunications service provider shall identify the telecommunications
network demarcation point(s) with an identification plate or label having:
(a) The provider's name;

(b) Custcmer/end user's name; and-
(c) If a CWSTP is used, the option type used.

(4) The CFR prescribes that telecommunications service providers shall choose
either a MPOE (Minimum Point of Entry) or CWSTP (Cable Wire Service
Termination Policy) which regulates where demarcations are placed within a
multi-tenant environment.

(5) A Telecommunications service provider, including its subcontractors and agents
provisioning service for a second provider who is not the end-user of the service,
shall place the point of demarcation no further than 12 inches from the nearest
POP (Point of Presence), of the serving provider, to the eventual end-user.

44



0948-ORD
02/21/08

(6) Telecommunications service providers shall designate each building that they

provide services to with labeling at the terminating point(s) of their facilities
indicating:

(a) Whether the building is under a MPOE policy; or

(b) Which option of a CWSTP is in effect.

(7) The CWSTP options for demarcation placement are as follows:

(a) All telecommunications service provider facilities will terminate at one

location, mutually agreed upon by the provider and the building owner or
designee, upon entry into the building, normally at the lowest common
serving point. All demarcations will be placed no more than 12 inches from
this point. The building owner and/or tenants will provide, manage and
maintain building wire and cable placed beyond this demarcation point
location.

(b) The telecommunications service provider's facilities will terminate at

common locations, mutually agreed upon by the provider and the building
owner or designee, throughout the building (terminal rooms, utility closets,
etc.). The telecommunications service provider will provide, manage and
maintain the building cable and registration jacks that denote the
demarcation points. The demarcation points will be placed at these
locations and will be accessible to end users at these locations. Option (ii)
is not an option for single tenant buildings.

(c) The telecommunications service provider will terminate facilities and place

demarcations at locations, mutually agreed upon by the provider and the
building owner or designee, within the individually occupied units, within
12 inches or a similarly reasonable distance of cable/wire entry. The
provider will provide, manage and maintain the building cable, network
terminating wire and registration jacks that denote the demarcation point.
Option (iii) is not an option for single tenant buildings.

(d) All telecommunications service provider facilities and demarcations will

terminate at one location on the property, mutually agreed upon by the
provider and the building owner or designee. The building owner and/or
tenants will provide, manage and maintain building wire and cable placed
beyond the demarcation point location.

(8) The telecommunications installer shall confer with the telecommunications
provider when determining the point of demarcation.

45



0948-ORD
06/20/07

23.30.900 Figures and Drawings.
The figures and drawings attached hereto as Attachment 1 are hereby adopted.

Section 2. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force five (5) days after its
passage and legal publication.

PASSED by the City Council this_#2™ day of _Qeesce , 2007, and
signed in authentication of its passage this 257"‘— day of M , 2007.

Grant S. Degginger, Mayor

(SEAL)

Approved as to form:

ri Rlordan City Attorney
/? \\}
7 1

Nary Kat Berens my City Attorney

Attest:

Myrra L. Basich, City Clerk
Published O \J e 2 3007

46



9 4o | abed

101-3 buimelq

s|ie}ag uoijejjelsuj }sej) 92IAI9S

80BUNG JOOY 8A0QY $587 .0 ,FZ }oxorig sonies - YBIH .9 19A0 JON 1SE

sleusel ysiuid

puy Buiweiy
|einonng Ta

v A\>1
I

INpuoo

8918 n_m_m/

v 104 paiog 8|oH
UM Spms 10
sia)jey usemiag
painoeg
OXZ "UIN

seo|buiys
10 s8sInon
Uiy Buiysel4

g
- sjeLsje|y ysiul
- puy Buiwe.l
| \ |einjonng
—
L Jnpuoy
.J |29)s pibiy
i v@ & Buppoeg pxz uin
. \‘ syog-n O/, "UIN
aoeuNg
Buipjing \\ (M3IA OLJPWOS| 99S) QX7
v/ puy iseiy suleby Ajpljog ‘sisjey yiog
MIIA 21418W0S| ussmieg uQ qeos ¢xz Bulyiesys jooy
mc_xoo_m, V\ 1suieby puy sisyey usamlag
(1 10N o03) o~ LhE Alpljog painoag 9xz Ul

aseg 19)9|\ PSS90y

.

doliq so1nieg

aseq 19)9N JUNO 8delIng

-buiysed )
4/Lmv_o§m_ 80INIBS
¥ pesylayieapp

| 900z pasinay

i




9 j0 7 abey

2014 @C_>>mt_ﬂ sjiejog uolijejjeisuj }sej\ 990IAIB8S
90BHING JOOY B8A0QY FZ JOAQ 18XoeIg 80IAM8S - YBIH 97 J19AQ 1SBIN ¥
e e e e — lv IIIIIIIIIIII
: L 11ejeq ind| ~ " fo,\\\\tm%\ .06 01 .09
T A < (X peaids saiip AnD
T 7U, T Jeuondo .Wiuﬁm&numﬂu foozzzzzzzzozo
ﬂ Jiog-9A3 jog N <
T wnpuod \ / paziuenes A e ]
1, | 1ees pib ynpuoy _»
i%x. S P \ %o;mms_ LO Buiyse|4 19915 PIBI] i &*
/ P A ((AEEREES
. . L dwen a|qen puy aoeng jusiiyoeny
\ Bubtoeg pixg U SIquIY L paziuees Buipiing .
> syjog-n B, UIIN Buppoeg vxz “UIN
\\ g puy Iseiy syog-n 0. Ul
Uasmiag R A
([ sjeuale ysiui4 puy mc&oo_m/ ) S|ELSIRI YSIUl
1+Nv \mEEmE [eanjonis — ..“ 6«@ __puy Buiwel
=¥ o =) 4 [ednonig

o |
A&_/_\/_/» ,, (z 18 293) puag / (101-3 U0 11E1eq / -
. L-snipey-oN ‘dieysg / s9g) Buiyse|d I\
PallHg puy pausjie| / }o¥oeIg S0INSG -

N, -spug *_NDUM A0 HNpUoH | QOgQ 20INIBS 7

T [e9IS pIBIY [/ uIN \
T \ aiqeD yelody
A i A ‘plomieddon g o
pESUISUIBOAA 1og :w\m UIA ._NDUM peayisylespp - Pl O 9 ON
JO dwep aous4
Murf-ureyg ‘siejiod
adA] Ba7-yi3s — Buihng adA] a|qen — BulAng

| 900Z pasiAey




9 4o ¢ abed

€0 L-3 buimeiq

(9 210N Jod) S|IE}9Q UOI}R||RISU| }SB|\ 9DIAIBS

90BLNG JOOY 9A0QY SS87 40 bz 19¥orig 82IAIeS

YbiH .92 J8AQ 10N 1se

Nnpuo) R
9913 PIBIY =Tl

ERTISEN /K

v 104 palog \

3|0H UIM
sjie] o)ey

ussmiag

painoeg

9XZ "UIiN

!\T|1

|
1

[e011309|3
‘‘‘‘‘ — llep-Aneal

MIIA JuUO.I4

T

T,

jpuueyD \ -

/ >{§\:}

RN

wnwiupy 8L M
\4
\

doiq @01n18g

v

. 1@)oelg 90IAI8S

(/Y peayloyieap

slaquia
Buiwesd pljog
Oju| painoag
sjjog-be
paziuenes)
St Wnuiuny

80BUNG JOOY BAOQY FZ JOAQ 18MoeIg 90IAIeS

YBIH .92 JenQ 1se|y

S &
adA ] alIpA -

uQ-puag
JoN-sdeng
[puuey)
paziueAjeo)
panosddy

e
Bulysel4

v
unpuop

|o31g pibry
dwe|n adid —
peziuenjeo //
Y

doig @o1n488

\M\ls

,,,,,,,,, |eouo9|g
\ :m>>t>>m®I

[puueyD

feuondo jog
-oA7 ‘onsep
10 Buiysey
vvvvv -UHM [B8S

//////

‘Plemuaddon g ‘oN

¥ jenb3uQ

9|qed yeslly

| 900Z pesirnay




Notes to drawings E-101, E-102, and E-103

(1) An approved roof flashing must be installed on each mast where it passes through a roof.
Plastic, nonhardening mastic must be placed between lead-type flashings and the conduit.
Neoprene type flashings will also be permitted to be used.

(2) Masts must be braced, secured, and supported in such a manner that no pressure from the
attached conductors will be exerted on a roof flashing, meter base, or other enclosures.

(3) Utilization of couplings for a mast are permitted only below the point the mast is braced,
secured, or supported.

(4) Except as otherwise required by the serving utility, service mast support guys must be
installed if the service drop attaches to the mast more than twenty-four inches above the roof
line or if the service drop is greater than one hundred feet in length from the pole or support.
Masts for support of other than service drops must comply with this requirement as well.

(5) Intermediate support masts must be installed in an approved manner with methods identical
or equal to those required for service masts.

(6) For altered services, where it is impractical to install U bolt mast supports due to interior
walls remaining closed, it will be permissible to use other alternate mast support methods such
as heavy gauge, galvanized, electrical channel material that is secured to two or more wooden
studs with five-sixteenths inch diameter or larger galvanized lag bolts.

(7) Conductors must extend at least eighteen inches from all mastheads to permit connection to
the connecting overhead wiring.

Page 4 of 6



Combustible Approved
u
Building Transformer

Surface Area

Figure 450-1

(b) A transformer installed adjacent to a building/structure with no combustible surface(s) may be
focated only in the shaded "Approved Transformer Area” shown in Figure 450-2;

Non- ' Approved
Combustible Transformer
Building
Surface

Figure 450-2

Page 5 of 6



Dispenser

Dock with
Void or Pit

Void/Pit

Water Line

Water Line 18"
Class 1, Division 1
Class 1, Division 2
Figure 555-1
Dispenser
Area below
Dock with no Dispenser
voids or pits

Class 1, Division 1

Class 1, Division 2

Figure 555-2

Page 6 of 6




